TABULATION SHEET

Bid Date: 2/11/2015 Bid #: SFB 15-122

Bid Time: 3:30 PM Title: Landscape Chemicals

Dept: Parks & Rec # of Plan Holders: 9

Vendor Qty Crop Production John Deere Simplot
Signature Yes Yes Yes
Addendum No Yes Yes

Treflan 5G 560 $330.40 $296.80 $403.20
Chaser 2 Amine, Turflon Il Amine, or Aquasweep 170 $6,738.80 $7,673.80 $6,596.00
Confront 40 $4,400.00 $5,268.00 $4,440.00
Hilight (dye, blue) 8 $300.00 No-Bid $296.00
Malice 0.5 G, Zenith 0.5 G, or Criterion 0.5 G* 2520 $1,562.40 No-Bid $1,701.00
Honcho Plus, or Credit 41 Extra, or Makaze, or 190

GlyStar Plus $2,327.50 No-Bid $2,280.00
QuickSilver 56 $826.00 $941.92 $826.00
Spreader 90, or Spray Wet 90 25 $347.50 No-Bid $350.00
Imida E Pro 2F, or: Mallet 2F Insecticide, or LADA 5

2F Insecticide ** $247.00 $262.30 $250.00
M-PEDE 25 $62.50 $72.05 $64.00
Cutring Plus 2 $40.78 $47.98 $43.50
Wasp Freeze. or StingRay 84 $545.16 $609.00 $546.00
Casoron 4G, or Barrier 4G 100 $229.00 $246.00 $224.00
Lake Pak WSP 180 $3,688.20 $5,067.00 $3,880.80
Telar XP 10 $174.40 No-Bid $168.75
Alamo 5 $1,115.00 $1,710.80 $1,400.00
Dimension 270G 1500 $1,170.00 $1,125.00 $1,140.00
Phyton 27 ! $239.00 No-Bid $190.00
Phyton 35 ! $215.00 No-Bid $175.00
Surflan 25 $1,121.75 $1,173.25 $1,040.00
Fusilade Il ! $59.00 $64.12 $61.00
Finale 25 $142.43 $154.40 $120.00
Total $25,881.82 $24,712.42 $26,195.25
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